
 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 
June 11 - How the Other Half Loves 
Britain’s brilliant comic genius, Sir Alan Ayckbourn 
serves us a fast-paced and hilariously funny 
theatrical meal. This classic modern comedy is a 
portrait of three very different marriages that turns 
into a spirited game of mixed doubles involving sex, 
jealousy and ingenious stagecraft. Full of clever, 
razor-sharp dialogue and impeccable split-second 
timing and twists, HOW THE OTHER HALF LOVES 
promises to leave you in stitches. 
 
August 13 - Mary Poppins  
One of the most popular stories of all time that has 
captured hearts in a whole new way: as a practically 
perfect musical! When their children, Jane and 
Michael, become increasingly unruly, the Banks 
parents seek a new nanny to instill discipline. Enter 
Mary Poppins, a magical and whimsical woman who 
brings joy, fun, and a bit of mischief into their lives. 
With the help of her friend Bert, a charming chimney 
sweep, Mary teaches the children valuable life 
lessons through delightful adventures. 
 
 

September 3 - Stag and Doe   
Bonnie and Brad are throwing the obligatory Stag 
and Doe to pay for their upcoming wedding. Their 
Maid of Honour, Dee, is still getting over being left at 
the altar seven years ago. Mandy and Rob are 
getting married today – even if their big white tent  
 

 
 
 

just blew away in a storm. And Chef Jay’s entire 
catering staff have been arrested! It’s all happening  
at the same time, in the same community hall 
kitchen. STAG AND DOE offers an affectionate and 
hilarious look at this distinctly Canadian prenuptial 
tradition and the joys of small-town life.  
 
October 22 - 9 to 5 
Pushed to the boiling point, three coworkers, Violet, 
Judy and Doralee, concoct a plan to kidnap and turn 
the tables on the egotistical, lying, hypocritical bigot 
they call their boss. Will the girls manage to reform 
the office – or will events unravel when the CEO pays 
an unexpected visit? Inspired by the cult film and 
brought to you by Dolly herself, this hilarious musical 
is about teaming up, standing up, and taking care of 
business!                                                                            
 

Cost Per Person:  $189 
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 

  Full Payment Due at Time of Booking 
  

300 Eagleson Road, Hazeldean Mall. Kanata, Ontario K2M 1C9 

613.723.5701 / 1.800.267.5288 
   Travel Registration #2967742-5000006 



 


